

KANSAS REGISTER

State of Kansas

JACK H. BRIER
Secretary of State

Vol. 1, No. 21

May 27, 1982

Pages 737-746

<i>IN THIS ISSUE</i>	<i>Page</i>
<i>✓ Kansas Fish and Game Commission</i>	
Open Meeting Notice	738
<i>Northwest Kansas Groundwater Management District No. 4</i>	
Open Meeting Notice	738
<i>✓ Department of Administration</i>	
Notice of Commencement of Negotiations	738
<i>✓ Kansas' Park and Resources Authority</i>	
Notice of Public Hearing	739
<i>Notice to Bidders for State Purchases</i>	739
<i>✓ Consumer Credit Commissioner</i>	
Notices of Public Hearings on Proposed Regulations	741
<i>Notices of Bond Sales</i>	
City of Caney	742
City of Tonganoxie	743
City of Topeka	744

State of Kansas
FISH AND GAME COMMISSION

OPEN MEETING NOTICE

A meeting of the Kansas Fish and Game Commission is scheduled for Wednesday, June 2, 9:00 a.m., at the Commission Headquarters in Pratt. General business matters including a review of Commission projects and activities will be discussed.

JOE P. RISHEL
 Commission Chairman

Doc. No. 000370

State of Kansas
**NORTHWEST KANSAS GROUNDWATER
 MANAGEMENT DISTRICT #4**

OPEN MEETING NOTICE

The June meeting of the Northwest Kansas Groundwater Management District No. 4 is scheduled for June 3, 1982 at the district office, 1175 South Range, Colby, Kansas. The meeting begins at 10:00 a.m. General administrative matters and other business will be discussed.

WAYNE A. BOSSERT
 Manager

Doc. No. 000362

State of Kansas
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

**NOTICE OF COMMENCEMENT OF
 NEGOTIATIONS FOR ARCHITECTURAL
 AND ENGINEERING SERVICES**

Notice is hereby given of the commencement of negotiations for contracts for architectural and engineering services for the following projects:

Architectural

- Remodeling of Employee Dormitory for Administration Building, Osawatomie State Hospital
- Addition to Ablah Library, Wichita State University

Engineering

- Addition to Applegate Energy Center, University of Kansas Medical Center
- New Heating Plant and Steam Distribution System, Youth Center at Topeka

The State Building Advisory Commission will nominate Architectural and Engineering firms for the above projects on June 23, 1982. Nominated engineering firms will be interviewed by an engineering negotiating committee for the Kansas University Medical Center project on July 13, 1982, and on June 14, 1982 for the Youth Center at Topeka project. Architectural negotiating committee meetings have not been scheduled. Negotiations for ancillary technical services will be conducted for the above projects as required.

There may be other smaller state projects requiring architectural or engineering services throughout the fiscal year ending June 30, 1983. Interested architects and engineers may be considered for such projects by submitting a statement of qualifications and performance data pursuant to K.S.A. 1981 Supp. 75-5403 and 75-5803. Forms for submitting such statements may be obtained from the Division of Architectural Services, Attention Mr. Jack Nelson, 625 Polk Street, Topeka, Kansas 66603, Telephone Number: (913) 233-9367.

DIVISION OF ARCHITECTURAL SERVICES

Doc. No. 000367

The *Kansas Register* is an official publication of the State of Kansas, published by authority of K.S.A. 1981 Supp. 75-430. The *Kansas Register* is published weekly by the Kansas Secretary of State; State Capitol; Topeka, Kansas 66612. One-year subscriptions are \$47.50; single copies may be purchased, if available, for \$2.00 each. Second class postage paid at Topeka, Kansas.

ISSN No. 0744-2254.

Postmaster: Send change of address form to *Kansas Register*; Secretary of State; State Capitol; Topeka, Kansas 66612.

© Secretary of State of the State of Kansas 1982. Reproduction of this publication in its entirety or for commercial purposes is prohibited without prior permission. Official enactments of the Kansas Legislature, and proposed and adopted administrative regulations of state agencies may be reproduced in any form without permission.

PUBLISHED BY
JACK H. BRIER
 Secretary of State
 State Capitol
 Topeka, Kansas 66612



PHONE: 913/296-2236

Carol A. Bell
 Publications Director

State of Kansas

PARK AND RESOURCES AUTHORITY**NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING**

You are hereby notified that the Kansas Park and Resources Authority will hold a public hearing at 7:00 p.m. Friday, June 11, 1982 at Tuttle Creek State Park, River Pond, main wooden shelter next to campground, on regulations proposed to be amended by the Authority. All interested parties may present oral or written comments at the hearing. Additional information on the public hearing or proposed regulations may be obtained by contacting the Park and Resources Authority office in Topeka.

The regulations to be amended are as follows:

1. Overnight camping—Proposed amendment will establish a \$2.00 per night per unit fee for camping units.
2. Overnight camping with utility charge for electricity (per night) \$2.00 increased to \$3.00.
3. Overnight camping with utility charge for electricity, water, and sewer hookup (per night) \$3.00 increased to \$5.00.

LYNN BURRIS, JR.
Director

Doc. No. 000368

State of Kansas

**DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF PURCHASES****NOTICE TO BIDDERS**

Sealed bids for items hereinafter listed will be received by James I. Tolbert, Director of Purchases, State Office Building, Topeka, Kansas, until 2:00 p.m., C.S.T., or D.S.T., whichever is in effect on the date indicated, and then will be publicly opened:

MONDAY, JUNE 7, 1982

#49981

Kansas State Penitentiary, Lansing—TWO-WAY RADIO EQUIPMENT

#50291

Kansas State University, Manhattan—LABORATORY CABINETS

#50353

Department of Transportation, Topeka—LUBRICATING OIL

#50392

Kansas State University, Manhattan—MEAT PRODUCTS

#50393

Kansas State University, Manhattan—GARDEN TRACTOR

#50429

University of Kansas Medical Center, Kansas City—REPAIR PARTS AND LABOR FOR X-RAY EQUIPMENT

#50430

Department of Administration, Topeka—ENVELOPES—WHITE-WOVE-WINDOW-K-BEN 272 and 2721, for Division of Printing

#50455

Department of Revenue, Topeka—ENVELOPES—WINDOW-FORM TR-59A

#50473

University of Kansas, Lawrence—REFINISH METAL OFFICE FURNITURE

#50474

Kansas Neurological Institute, Topeka—INSTITUTIONAL PATIENT CLOTHING

#50480

Department of Transportation—MINUS 2' CRUSHER, RUN AGGREGATE, for various locations near Manhattan, Sabetha and Junctions US-75 and K-20

TUESDAY, JUNE 8, 1982

#25169

Statewide—CANNED GOODS

#25171

Statewide—CEREALS

#50431

Pittsburg State University, Pittsburg—ROLL PAPER TOWELS

#50432

University of Kansas, Lawrence—LOUNGE TABLES

#50433

University of Kansas, Lawrence—MICROFILM READING CARRELS

#50434

Kansas State University, Manhattan—ELECTRONIC LABORATORY BALANCES

#50456

Department of Revenue—COILED AND PAINTED ALUMINUM, for Center Industries Corporation, Wichita, Kansas

#50475

University of Kansas, Lawrence—CONTINUOUS FORMS—I PART

#50499

Department of Social and Rehabilitation Services, Topeka—LABOR, MATERIAL FOR ALUMINUM SLIDING DOORS INSTALLATION

#A-4215

University of Kansas Medical Center, Kansas City—REMODEL E.N.T. OUTPATIENT UNIT

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 9, 1982

#25176

University of Kansas, Lawrence—MEAT PRODUCTS (JULY 1982)

#50435

Kansas State Penitentiary, Lansing—BREATHING APPARATUS

#50436

Kansas State Penitentiary, Lansing—CHURCH FURNITURE

#50437

Department of Revenue, Topeka—PORTABLE ORAL-VISUAL TESTING MACHINE

#50476

Department of Transportation—CONCRETE SAWS, for Norton and Topeka

(continued)

#50477

Kansas State University, Manhattan—AIR FILTERS

#50494

Department of Revenue—REFLECTIVE SHEETING FOR LICENSE PLATES, for Center Industries Corporation, Wichita, Kansas

#A-4272(c)

University of Kansas Medical Center, Kansas City—ENERGY CONSERVATION IMPROVEMENTS, REINSULATION OF PIPING SYSTEM

#A-4477

Wichita State University, Wichita—SEAL JOINTS AND REPLACE DAMAGED PANELS IN CESSNA STADIUM FACILITY

#A-4485

University of Kansas, Lawrence—REPLACEMENT WINDOWS (PHASE I) OF KANSAS MEMORIAL UNION BLDG.

THURSDAY, JUNE 10, 1982

#25148

University of Kansas Medical Center, Lawrence and Statewide—DRESSINGS AND PATIENT CARE ITEMS (CLASS 02)

#25175

Statewide—JULY (1982) MEAT PRODUCTS

#25177

Department of Health and Environment, Topeka—BIOLOGICALS, VACCINES AND DIETARY FORMULA

#50478

Department of Transportation, Garden City—GRADER BLADES

#50492

Department of Transportation, Chanute—TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING TAPE

#50495

Kansas State University, Manhattan—PARTS FOR COMBINE

#50496

Department of Transportation—PORTABLE TOOL STANDS, for Salina, Norton and Hutchinson, Ks.

#50497

Kansas State University—GRAIN BINS, for various locations in Manhattan, Hesston, Topeka, St. John, Ottawa and Powhattan, Ks.

#50498

Pittsburg State University, Pittsburg—PROJECTORS

#50500

Kansas State Penitentiary, Lansing—WELL CLEANING

#50501

Department of Revenue, Topeka—ENVELOPES—TWO-WAY-VEHICLE REGISTRATION RENEWALS

#50334

Wichita State University, Wichita—MICROCOMPUTER EQUIPMENT

#50369

University of Kansas, Lawrence—VIDEO EQUIPMENT

#A-4283(a) & A-4487

University of Kansas, Lawrence—CONSTRUCTION OF PARKING LOTS A & B

#A-4309

Youth Center At Topeka—FURNISH AND INSTALL FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS, in Various Campus Buildings

#A-4476

Wichita State University, Wichita—ROOFING SYSTEM REPLACEMENT, of Fairmont Towers

FRIDAY, JUNE 11, 1982

#49992

Department of Transportation, Topeka—GUARD RAIL ACCESSORIES, for Olathe, Kansas

#50355

Department of Administration, Topeka—MAILING MACHINES, for Division of General Services

#50515

University of Kansas Medical Center, Kansas City—MEAT PRODUCTS

MONDAY, JUNE 14, 1982

#50491

Kansas Fish and Game Commission, Pratt—CARPETING AND INSTALLATION, for various locations near Tonganoxie, Bennington, St. Paul and Meade, Ks.

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 16, 1982

#25173

Statewide—BATTERIES

FRIDAY, JUNE 18, 1982

#50493

Department of Transportation, Norton—ASPHALT RUBBER SEALING COMPOUND

JAMES I. TOLBERT
Director of Purchases

Doc. No. 000366

State of Kansas

CONSUMER CREDIT COMMISSIONER

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

You are hereby notified that the office of the Consumer Credit Commissioner will hold a public hearing at 10:00 a.m. on June 11, 1982, at 535 Kansas Avenue, Suite 1114, Topeka, Kansas on proposed temporary and permanent regulations 75-6-24 and 75-6-27. All interested parties may present oral or written comments at the hearing.

The regulations proposed to be adopted are as follows:

75-6-24. Adjustment in dollar amounts. The dollar amounts of three hundred dollars (\$300) and one thousand dollars (\$1,000) in K.S.A. 1979 Supp. 16a-2-401(2) shall be changed to ~~four hundred twenty dollars (\$420)~~ five hundred forty dollars (\$540) and ~~one thousand four hundred dollars (\$1,400)~~ one thousand eight hundred dollars (\$1,800).

The provisions of this section shall be effective on and after July 1, 1982. (Authorized by K.S.A. 1981 16a-2-401a and 16a-6-104(1)(e); effective E-79-9, April 20, 1978; effective May 1, 1979; amended E-81-15, June 25, 1980; amended May 1, 1981; amended E)

75-6-24. Adjustment in dollar amounts. The dollar amounts of three hundred dollars (\$300) and one thousand dollars (\$1,000) in K.S.A. 1979 Supp. 16a-2-401(2) shall be changed to ~~four hundred twenty dollars (\$420)~~ five hundred forty dollars (\$540) and ~~one thousand four hundred dollars (\$1,400)~~ one thousand eight hundred dollars (\$1,800). (Authorized by K.S.A. 1981 16a-2-401a and 16a-6-104(1)(e); effective E-79-9, April 20, 1978; effective May 1, 1979; amended E-81-15, June 25, 1980; amended May 1, 1981; amended E ; effective May 1, 1983.)

75-6-27. Earned finance charge by the actuarial method. The amount of the earned portion of the precomputed finance charge, and any deferral charges, on a consumer credit transaction that is entered into on or after July 1, 1982, and payable according to its original terms over more than 61 months, shall be determined by applying the contract rate according to the actuarial method to: (a) the unpaid balances and time as originally scheduled for the period preceding prepayment. The period preceding prepayment shall be full days between prepayment date and the beginning of the computational period in which prepayment occurs, and all fully expired computational periods preceding prepayment date; or

(b) the actual unpaid balances of the amount financed for the actual time the unpaid balances were outstanding. Any delinquency or deferral charges collected before the date of prepayment shall be applied to reduce the amount financed as of the date collected. (Authorized by K.S.A. 16a-6-104(e); implementing K.S.A. 16a-2-510(4); effective E)

75-6-27. Earned finance charge by the actuarial method. The amount of the earned portion of the precomputed finance charge, and any deferral charges, on a consumer credit transaction that is entered into on

or after July 1, 1982, and payable according to its original terms over more than 61 months, shall be determined by applying the contract rate according to the actuarial method to: (a) the unpaid balances and time as originally scheduled for the period preceding prepayment. The period preceding prepayment shall be full days between prepayment date and the beginning of the computational period in which prepayment occurs, and all fully expired computational periods preceding prepayment date; or

(b) the actual unpaid balances of the amount financed for the actual time the unpaid balances were outstanding. Any delinquency or deferral charges collected before the date of prepayment shall be applied to reduce the amount financed as of the date collected. (Authorized by K.S.A. 16a-6-104(e); implementing K.S.A. 16a-2-510(4); effective E ; effective May 1, 1983.)

DONALD O. PHELPS
Consumer Credit Commissioner

Doc. No. 000364

State of Kansas

CONSUMER CREDIT COMMISSIONER

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

You are hereby notified that the office of the Consumer Credit Commissioner will hold a public hearing at 11:00 a.m. on June 11, 1982, at 535 Kansas Avenue, Suite 1114, Topeka, Kansas on proposed temporary and permanent regulation 75-8-3, proposed amended regulation 75-8-11, proposed revocation of regulation 75-8-12, and proposed temporary and permanent regulation 75-8-13. All interested parties may present oral or written comments at the hearing.

The regulations proposed to be adopted are as follows:

75-8-3. Acceptable assets. An investment company shall not invest in or own assets, or incur liabilities which are not inherent to the principal business of a licensed lender under the Kansas uniform consumer credit code, except: (a) loan contracts when the proceeds of the loan are used for business or agricultural purposes; (b) installment sales contracts or leases of personal property when used for agricultural or business purposes; or (c) the purchase of commercial paper. ~~this~~ This restriction shall not apply to the owning of real or personal property necessary to the accommodation of that business. (Authorized by and implementing K.S.A. 16-629(b); effective E-82-23, December 9, 1981; effective May 1, 1982; effective E)

75-8-3. Acceptable assets. An investment company shall not invest in or own assets, or incur liabilities which are not inherent to the principal business of a licensed lender under the Kansas uniform consumer credit code, except: (a) loan contracts when the proceeds of the loan are used for business or agricultural purposes; (b) installment sales contracts or leases of personal property when used for agricultural or business purposes; or (c) the purchase of commercial (continued)

paper. This restriction shall not apply to the owning of real or personal property necessary to the accommodation of that business. (Authorized by and implementing K.S.A. 16-629(b); effective E-82-23, December 9, 1981; effective May 1, 1982; effective E ; effective May 1, 1983.)

75-8-11. Stockholders meetings. Minutes shall be made of all stockholders' meetings and these minutes shall show all action taken by the stockholders, which shall include, but not be limited to, the election of all directors. (Authorized by K.S.A. 16-629(a); implementing K.S.A. 16-602(b); effective E-82-23, December 9, 1981; effective May 1, 1982; effective May 1, 1983.)

75-8-12. (Authorized by K.S.A. 16-629(a); implementing K.S.A. 16-601(30); effective E-82-23, December 9, 1981; effective May 1, 1982; revoked May 1, 1983.)

75-8-13. Investments. An investment company shall not purchase or own commercial paper which does not have a quality rating by Standard and Poor's Corporation of A1 or A2 or by Moody's Investors Services, Inc. of Prime-1 or Prime-2. (Authorized by and implementing K.S.A. 16-601(8); effective E .)

75-8-13. Investments. An investment company shall not purchase or own commercial paper which does not have a quality rating by Standard an Poor's Corporation of A1 or A2 or by Moody's Investors Services, Inc. of Prime-1 or Prime-2. (Authorized by and implementing K.S.A. 16-601(8); effective E ; effective May 1, 1983.)

DONALD O. PHELPS
Consumer Credit Commissioner

Doc. No. 000365

(Published in the KANSAS REGISTER, May 27, 1982.)

**NOTICE OF BOND SALE
\$150,000.00
GENERAL OBLIGATION SEWER
IMPROVEMENT BONDS
OF THE
CITY OF CANEY, KANSAS**

The CITY OF CANEY, KANSAS will receive sealed bids at the OFFICE OF THE CITY CLERK, 211 WEST FIFTH STREET, CANEY, KANSAS, until 7:30 o'clock P.M., C.D.T., on

JUNE 7, 1982

for \$150,000.00 par value GENERAL OBLIGATION SEWER IMPROVEMENT BONDS of the City, at which time and place such bids will be publicly opened. No oral or auction bids will be considered.

All of the Bonds will be negotiable coupon bonds, will be in denominations of \$5,000.00 each, and the Bonds will be dated JULY 1, 1982. The Bonds will mature serially in accordance with the following schedule:

<i>Principal Amount</i>	<i>Maturity Date</i>
\$15,000.00	October 1, 1983
15,000.00	October 1, 1984
15,000.00	October 1, 1985

15,000.00	October 1, 1986
15,000.00	October 1, 1987
15,000.00	October 1, 1988
15,000.00	October 1, 1989
15,000.00	October 1, 1990
15,000.00	October 1, 1991
15,000.00	October 1, 1992

Interest on the Bonds will first be payable on APRIL 1, 1983, and thereafter semiannually on the first days of APRIL 1 and OCTOBER 1 in each year until the Bonds are fully paid. Both the principal of and interest on the Bonds will be payable to bearer at the Office of the State Treasurer in the City of Topeka, Kansas.

Proposals will be received on the Bonds bearing such rate or rates of interest, not exceeding five (5) different interest rates, as may be specified by the bidder. The repetition of a rate will not constitute one of said maximum number of rates. The same rate shall apply to all Bonds of the same maturity. Each interest rate specified shall be in an even multiple of one-eighth (1/8th) or one-twentieth (1/20th) of One percent (1%). The difference between the highest and lowest coupon rates specified in any bid shall not exceed three per cent (3%). No interest rate shall exceed the maximum rate therefor as prescribed by the laws of the State of Kansas, and no bid of less than par and accrued interest will be considered. Bids involving the use of extra or supplemental coupons will not be considered. Bids for less than the entire issue of Bonds will not be considered.

Bids shall be submitted on the OFFICIAL BID FORM furnished by the City, and shall be addressed to the City at 211 WEST FIFTH STREET, CANEY, KANSAS 67333, ATTENTION: CAROLE COKER, CITY CLERK, and shall be plainly marked BOND BID. All bids must state the total interest cost of the bid, the premium, if any, the net interest cost of the bid, and the average annual interest rate, all certified by the bidder to be correct; and the City will be entitled to rely on the certificate of correctness of the bidder. Each bid must be accompanied by a certified or cashier's check equal to Two percent (2%) of the total amount of the bid, and shall be payable to TREASURER, CITY OF CANEY, KANSAS. In the event a bidder whose bid is accepted shall fail to carry out his Contract of Purchase, said deposit shall be retained by the City as liquidated damages. The checks of unsuccessful bidders will be returned promptly.

The Bonds, duly printed, executed and registered, will be furnished and paid for by the City; and the Bonds will be sold subject to the unqualified approving opinion of GAAR & BELL, Bond Counsel, of Wichita, Kansas, whose opinion will be paid for by the City. The purchaser will be furnished with a complete Transcript of Proceedings evidencing the authorization and issuance of the Bonds; and the usual closing proofs, which will include a Certificate that there is no litigation pending or threatened at the time of delivery of the Bonds affecting their validity. Delivery of the Bonds will be made to the successful bidder on or before JULY 7, 1982, at any bank in the STATE OF KANSAS or KANSAS CITY, MISSOURI, at the ex-

(continued)

pense of the City. Delivery elsewhere will be made at the expense of the purchaser.

The Bonds will constitute general obligations of the City, payable as to both principal and interest from ad valorem taxes which may be levied without limitation as to rate or amount upon all of the taxable tangible property within the territorial limits of the City. The Bonds are being issued for the purpose of repairing and/or reconstructing a Sewage Treatment Plant in the City.

The sealed bids for the Bonds shall be opened publicly and only at the time and place specified in this Notice; and the Bonds will be sold to the best bidder. The City reserves the right to reject any/or all of the bids, and to waive any irregularities. Unless all bids are rejected, the Bonds will be awarded to the bidder whose proposal results in the lowest net interest cost to the City; and the net interest cost will be determined by deducting the amount of any premium paid from the aggregate amount of interest upon all of the Bonds from their date until their respective maturities.

Assessed valuation figures for the City of Caney, Kansas, for the year 1981, are as follows:

Equalized Assessed Valuation of Taxable Tangible Property	\$3,482,951.00
Tangible Valuation of Motor Vehicles	\$ 892,752.00
Tangible Valuation of Motor Vehicle Dealers Inventory	<u>\$ 44,862.00</u>
Equalized Assessed Valuation for Computation of Bonded Debt Limitations	\$4,420,565.00

The total bonded indebtedness of the City of Caney, Kansas, at the date hereof, including this \$150,000.00 proposed issue of Bonds, is in the amount of \$182,000.00. In addition, the City currently has outstanding temporary notes in the amount of \$15,000.00. It is anticipated that the City will issue an additional \$75,000.00 in temporary notes, said notes to be dated May 15, 1982.

DATED May 17, 1982.

CAROLE COKER, City Clerk
City of Caney, Kansas

Doc. No. 000358

(Published in the KANSAS REGISTER, May 27, 1982.)

NOTICE OF BOND SALE
\$120,785
CITY OF TONGANOXIE, KANSAS
GENERAL OBLIGATION BONDS
(Payable from unlimited
ad valorem taxes)
SERIES 1982-1
Dated June 1, 1982

Sealed bids will be received by the undersigned City Clerk of the City of Tonganoxie, Kansas, at the Meeting Room of the City Hall in said City until 8:00 p.m., Central Daylight Time, on Monday, June 7, 1982, at which time bids will be publicly opened for the sale of \$120,785 General Obligation Bonds, Series 1982-1 of the City of Tonganoxie, Kansas.

Said issue shall consist of 24 negotiable coupon bonds, each in the denomination of \$5,000.00 excepting Bond No. 1 which shall be in the denomination of

\$5,785. All of said bonds shall be dated June 1, 1982, and shall mature on December 1 in each year as follows:

Maturity	Amount	Maturity	Amount
1983	\$ 5,785	1988	\$10,000
1984	10,000	1989	15,000
1985	10,000	1990	15,000
1986	10,000	1991	15,000
1987	10,000	1992	20,000

Said bonds shall bear interest at the rate or rates to be determined as hereinafter provided, and said interest shall be payable on June 1, 1983, and thereafter semi-annually on December 1 and June 1 in each year. Both principal of and interest on said bonds shall be payable in lawful money of the United States of America at the State Treasurer of the State of Kansas, in the City of Topeka, Kansas.

Bids will be received on bonds bearing such rate or rates of interest as may be specified by the bidders subject to the following conditions: Not more than five different interest rates shall be specified and the same rate shall apply to all bonds of the same maturity. The repetition of an interest rate shall not constitute one of said maximum number of rates. Each interest rate shall be a multiple of one-eighth of one percent (1/8 of 1%) or one-twentieth of one percent (1/20 of 1%). The difference between the highest and lowest coupon rates specified in any bid shall not exceed three percent (3%) and no rate shall exceed the maximum legal rate. No supplemental interest coupons will be authorized and no bid of less than par and accrued interest will be considered. No proposal for the purchase of less than all of the bonds will be considered.

Each bid shall specify the total interest cost to the City during the life of the bond issue on the basis of such bid, the premium, if any, offered by the bidder, and the net interest cost to the City on the basis of such bid. The net interest cost to the City shall be determined by subtracting the amount of the premium, if any, from the total interest cost to the City and shall be stated as a dollar amount in the bid. The City shall be entitled to rely on such dollar amount as stated in the bid for the basis of determining the lowest net interest bid. If there is any discrepancy between said net interest cost and the average annual net interest rate specified, the specified net interest cost shall govern and the coupon rates specified in the bid shall be adjusted accordingly.

It is anticipated that CUSIP identification numbers will be printed on said bonds, but neither the failure to print such number on any bond nor any error with respect thereto shall constitute cause for a failure or refusal by the purchaser thereof to accept delivery thereof and to pay for said bonds in accordance with the terms of the purchase contract. Expenses related to the printing of CUSIP numbers on said bonds will be paid for by the City.

The City will furnish the bonds properly printed, without cost to the successful bidder, and said bonds will be subject to the approving opinion of Nichols and Wolfe—Chartered, Topeka, Kansas, whose unqualified approving opinion will be furnished and paid for by

(continued)

the City and delivered with the bonds together with a certified copy of transcript of proceedings authorizing said bonds.

Immediately following the sale of the bonds described, the City will proceed to have the bonds prepared and executed and will deliver such bonds to the successful bidder at any bank in the State of Kansas or Missouri designated by the successful bidder, or elsewhere at the expense of said bidder, within 45 days of sale date.

Payment for the bonds shall be made in lawful money of the United States of America, upon delivery to the successful bidder.

Bids shall be accompanied by a cashier's check or certified check on a bank located in the United States of America in the amount of two percent (2%) of the total par value of the bonds being sold, payable to the order of the City Clerk, Tonganoxie, Kansas, to secure the City from any loss resulting from the failure of the bidder to comply with the terms of his bid. No interest will be paid upon the deposit made by the successful bidder. The checks of the unsuccessful bidders will be returned promptly.

Bids must be made on forms which can be procured from the undersigned and should be addressed to Harriett Hughes, City Clerk, City Hall, 321 South Delaware, Tonganoxie, Kansas 66086, and marked "Bids for Purchase of Bonds."

No additions or alterations in such forms shall be made and any erasures may cause rejection of any bid. The City reserves the right to waive irregularities and to reject any or all bids.

The assessed valuation of the City of Tonganoxie, Kansas, for the year 1981 is \$3,228,338. The total outstanding bonded indebtedness of the City in general obligation bonds, including this proposed issue of bonds in the amount of \$120,785, is \$498,785.

Dated this 12th day of May, 1982.

HARRIETT J. HUGHES
City Clerk
321 South Delaware
Tonganoxie, Kansas 66086

Doc. No. 000357

(Published in the KANSAS REGISTER, May 27, 1982.)

NOTICE OF BOND SALE
\$6,500,000
GENERAL IMPROVEMENT BONDS
SERIES 1982-A
CITY OF TOPEKA, KANSAS
(General Obligations, Payable from Unlimited
Ad Valorem Taxes)

Sealed bids will be received by the City Clerk of Topeka, Kansas (the "City"), in the Commission Chamber in the City Hall, 215 S.E. 7th St, Topeka, Kansas 66603, until 10:00 o'clock A.M., C.D.T. on

Tuesday, June 1, 1982

at which time and place said bids will be publicly opened and read for the purchase of \$6,500,000 principal amount of General Improvement Bonds, Series 1982-A, of the City (hereinafter referred to collectively

as the "Bonds"). All bids received will be reported to the Board of Commissioners for determination of the best bid at a meeting of the Board to be held at said time, date and place.

Details of the Bonds

The Bonds will be negotiable coupon bonds in the denomination of \$5,000 each. The Bonds will be dated June 1, 1982, and will mature serially on October 1 of each year in the principal amounts as follows:

Year	Principal Amount	Year	Principal Amount
1983	\$ 50,000	1994	\$500,000
1984	50,000	1995	250,000
1985	50,000	1996	250,000
1986	100,000	1997	250,000
1987	500,000	1998	250,000
1988	500,000	1999	250,000
1989	500,000	2000	250,000
1990	500,000	2001	250,000
1991	500,000	2002	250,000
1992	500,000	2003	250,000
1993	500,000		

The Bonds will bear interest at rates to be determined when the Bonds are sold as hereinafter provided, which interest will be payable semiannually on April 1 and October 1 of each year, beginning on October 1, 1982

Place of Payment

Both principal and interest on the Bonds will be payable in lawful money of the United States of America at the Office of the State Treasurer in the City of Topeka, Kansas

Redemption of Bonds

The Bonds maturing on October 1, 1991, and thereafter; shall be subject to redemption and payment prior to maturity at the option of the City, in whole or in part on October 1, 1990, or on any interest payment date thereafter, in inverse numerical order at the redemption prices (expressed as percentages of principal amount set out below), plus accrued interest thereon to the date fixed for redemption and payment:

Redemption Dates	Redemption Price
October 1, 1990	101%
April 1, 1991 and October 1, 1991	100¾%
April 1, 1992 and October 1, 1992	100½%
April 1, 1993 and October 1, 1993	100¼%
April 1, 1994 and thereafter	100%

If the City shall call any of the Bonds for redemption prior to their maturity, the City shall publish a notice of said redemption once in a financial journal published in the City of New York, New York, said notice to be published not less than thirty (30) days prior to the day fixed for redemption. Written notice of such redemption shall also be sent by United States registered or certified mail to the office of the State Treasurer, Topeka, Kansas, and to the manager or managers of the underwriting account making the successful bid not less than thirty (30) days prior to the date fixed for redemption.

(continued)

Security for the Bonds

The General Improvement Bonds, Series 1982-A, will be general obligations of the City payable as to both principal and interest in part from special assessments levied upon the property benefitted by such improvements and if not so paid, from ad valorem taxes which may be levied without limitation upon all the taxable tangible property, real and personal, within the territorial limits of the City, the balance being payable from ad valorem taxes which may be levied without limitation as to rate or amount on all the taxable tangible property within the City.

Conditions of Bids

Bids will be received on the Bonds bearing such rate or rates of interest as may be specified by the bidders, subject to the following conditions: The Bonds will be sold in one block on an "all or none" basis. The same rate shall apply to all Bonds maturing in the same year. Each interest rate specified shall be a multiple of $\frac{1}{8}$ or $\frac{1}{20}$ of 1%. No interest rate shall exceed a rate equal to the 20 bond index of tax exempt municipal bonds published by the weekly Bond Buyer, in New York, New York, on the Monday next preceding the day on which the Bonds are sold, plus 2%, and the difference between the highest and lowest interest rates specified in any bid shall not exceed 1%. No bid less than the principal amount of the Bonds plus accrued interest thereon to the date of their delivery will be considered, and no bid providing for supplemental interest coupons will be considered.

Basis of Award

Each bid shall specify the total interest cost to the City during the life of the Bonds on the basis of such bid, the premium, if any, offered by the bidder, the net interest cost to the City on the basis of such bid, and the average annual net interest rate on the basis of such bid. The net interest cost to the City shall be determined by subtracting the amount of the premium, if any, from the total interest cost to the City and shall be stated as a dollar amount in the bid. The City shall be entitled to rely upon such dollar amount as stated in the bid as the basis for determining the lowest net interest cost bid. If there is any discrepancy between said net interest cost and the average annual net interest rate specified, the specified net interest cost shall govern and the coupon rates specified in the bid shall be adjusted accordingly.

Delivery of and Payment for the Bonds

The City will pay for printing and registering the Bonds and will deliver the same properly executed and registered to the successful bidder within 45 days from the date of sale at such bank or trust company located in the United States of America, as may be specified by the successful bidder without cost of the successful bidder. Payment for the Bonds shall be made in Federal Funds or other funds which shall be available to the City on the same day as delivery of the Bonds. The successful bidder will be furnished with a certified transcript evidencing the authorization and issuance of the Bonds and the usual closing proofs, which will include a certificate that there is no litigation pending

or threatened at the time of the delivery of the Bonds affecting their validity.

Legal Opinion

The Bonds will be sold subject to the legal opinion of Gaar & Bell, Overland Park, Kansas, Bond Counsel, whose unqualified approving opinion will be furnished and paid for by the City and will be printed on the Bonds.

CUSIP Numbers

At the request of the successful bidder, CUSIP identification numbers will be printed on the Bonds, but neither the failure to print such number on any bond nor any error with respect thereto shall constitute cause for failure or refusal by the purchaser thereof to accept delivery of and pay for the Bonds in accordance with the terms of the successful bid and this Notice of Bond Sale. All expenses in relation to the printing of CUSIP numbers on the Bonds, including the CUSIP Service Bureau charge in the assignment of said numbers, will be paid for by the City.

Good Faith Deposit

Each bid must be accompanied by a good faith deposit in the form of a cashier's or certified check in the amount of \$130,000, made payable to the order of the Treasurer of the City of Topeka, Kansas. Such check, or the proceeds thereof, will be held by the Treasurer pending payment for and delivery of the Bonds to the successful bidder. In the event the successful bidder shall fail to carry out its contract of purchase, the amount of said deposit shall be retained by the City as liquidated damages. No interest will be paid on the deposit made by the successful bidder.

Bid Forms

All bids shall be subject to the terms and conditions contained in this Notice of Bond Sale, and must be made on the forms which may be obtained from the City Clerk. No additions or alterations shall be made to such forms and any erasures may cause rejection of any bid. The right is reserved to waive irregularities and reject any and all bids.

Submission of Bids

Mailed bids may be addressed to the undersigned, City Clerk, City Hall, 215 S.E. 7th Street, Topeka, Kansas 66603, and marked "Bid for the purchase of Bonds."

Assessed Valuation and Indebtedness

The total assessed valuation of the taxable tangible property within the City for the year 1981 is \$355,325,681. The total general obligation bonded indebtedness of the City as of the date of the Bonds, including the Bonds, is \$47,464,000. In addition, the City has outstanding as of the date of the Bonds, \$11,305,600 of temporary notes, of which \$5,279,000 will be retired out of the proceeds of the Bonds herein offered for sale.

Bond Ratings

The outstanding general obligation bonds of the City are rated "Aal" by Moody's Investor Service, Inc.,

(continued)

and the City has applied for rating on the Bonds herein offered for sale.

Official Statement

Upon the sale of the Bonds, the City will adopt an Official Statement in substantially the form as the Preliminary Official Statement, subject to minor amendments and supplementation. Copies of the City's Preliminary Official Statement relating to the Bonds may be obtained from the City Clerk or the City's Financial Advisor, Shearson/American Express Inc., 2345 Grand Avenue, Suite 1600, Kansas City, Missouri 64108 (816/346-6112). Upon request, a reasonable number of copies of the Official Statement will be made available to the successful bidder without charge. Additional copies may be obtained at the expense of such bidder.

Financial Information

Figures used in this Notice of Bond Sale and in the Official Statement to show financial information concerning the City through December 31, 1981, and to the date of the Bonds, were obtained from the City's combined financial statements, years ending December 31, 1981 and 1980, which are attached as the Appendix to the Official Statement and from the Office of the City Auditor.

DATED this 20th day of May, 1982.

NORMA E. ROBBINS
City Clerk
City Hall
215 S.E. 7th Street
Topeka, Kansas 66603
(913-295-3940)

Doc. No. 000363

KANSAS REGISTER
Secretary of State
State Capitol
Topeka, Kansas 66612

Second Class
postage paid
at
Topeka, Kansas

**Use this form (or a copy of it) to enter a
SUBSCRIPTION**

_____ One-year subscriptions @ \$47.50 ea.

TOTAL ENCLOSED _____
(Make checks payable to Kansas Register)

SEND TO: _____
(Please, no
more than
4 address
lines.)

Zip code must be included

**THIS SPACE FOR REGISTER OFFICE
USE ONLY, PLEASE**

CODE _____ REC. NO. _____
EXPIRES _____ ENTERED BY _____

MAIL FORM WITH PAYMENT TO: "Kansas Register"; Secretary of State; State Capitol; Topeka, KS 66612

**Use this form (or a copy of it) for
CHANGE OF ADDRESS**

Remove your mailing label (above) and affix it here:

Indicate change or correction of name or address
here:

MAIL TO: "Kansas Register"; Secretary of State; State Capitol; Topeka, KS 66612